

Paper Supplies 2020-2021			dp supply			bye-mo' inc			school specialty inc.			pyramid school products			quill llc			lorenz supply			contract paper group			central poly bag corp.		
Description	Item #	Quant.	Brand Name	Unit Price	Total Price	Brand Name	Unit Price	Total Price	Brand Name	Unit Price	Total Price	Brand Name	Unit Price	Total Price	Brand Name	Unit Price	Total Price	Brand Name	Unit Price	Total Price	Brand Name	Unit Price	Total Price	Brand Name	Unit Price	Total Price
CARDBOARD CHIPBOARD: Gray 26" x 38" Light weight	P 01-030	20 Each		no bid																						
CARDBOARD POSTER BOARD: White on one side, 22" x 34"	P 04-400	900 Each		no bid																						
ASSORTED COLORS, PACON	P 06-010	50 PKGS		no bid		American Paper Al	\$ 0.2495	\$ 224.55	School Smart	\$ 0.2118	\$ 196.30	Pacon 5461	\$ 0.250	\$ 225.00		no bid										
BLACK, PACON 575C	P 06-020	50 PKGS		no bid		Tru-Ray	\$ 3.380	\$ 169.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray -08	\$ 3.02	\$ 151.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray	\$ 3.090	\$ 154.50	Tru-Ray 03063	\$ 3.69	\$ 184.50									
MEDIUM BLUE, PACON 335C	P 06-030	50 PKGS		no bid		Tru-Ray	\$ 2.580	\$ 129.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray -05	\$ 2.30	\$ 115.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray	\$ 2.490	\$ 124.50	Tru-Ray 03061	\$ 3.78	\$ 189.00									
DARK BROWN, PACON 505C	P 06-040	50 PKGS		no bid		Tru-Ray (blue)	\$ 2.440	\$ 122.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray -05	\$ 2.79	\$ 139.50	Pacon/Tru-Ray	\$ 2.890	\$ 144.50	Tru-Ray (royal blue) 03049	\$ 3.28	\$ 164.00									
HOLIDAY GREEN, PACON	P 06-050	50 PKGS		no bid		Tru-Ray	\$ 2.720	\$ 136.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray -05	\$ 2.59	\$ 129.50	Pacon/Tru-Ray	\$ 2.890	\$ 144.50	Tru-Ray 03056	\$ 3.87	\$ 193.50									
LIGHT BLUE, PACON 215C	P 06-060	50 PKGS		no bid		Tru-Ray	\$ 2.500	\$ 125.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray -21	\$ 2.83	\$ 141.50	Pacon/Tru-Ray	\$ 2.990	\$ 149.50	Tru-Ray 02961	\$ 3.77	\$ 188.50									
LIGHT GREEN, PACON 195C	P 06-070	50 PKGS		no bid		Tru-Ray (sky blue)	\$ 2.210	\$ 110.50	Pacon/Tru-Ray -05	\$ 2.50	\$ 125.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray	\$ 2.690	\$ 134.50	03048	\$ 3.28	\$ 164.00									
LIGHT ORANGE, PACON 275C	P 06-080	50 PKGS		no bid		Tru-Ray	\$ 2.370	\$ 118.50	Pacon/Tru-Ray -05	\$ 2.59	\$ 129.50	Pacon/Tru-Ray	\$ 2.990	\$ 149.50	Tru-Ray (festive green) 03038	\$ 3.87	\$ 193.50									
LIGHT VIOLET, 245C	P 06-100	50 PKGS		no bid		Tru-Ray (orange)	\$ 2.780	\$ 139.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray -15	\$ 2.66	\$ 133.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray	\$ 2.890	\$ 144.50		no bid										
SCARLET (DK MAROON) PACON	P 06-110	50 PKGS		no bid		Tru-Ray	\$ 2.370	\$ 118.50	Pacon/Tru-Ray -05	\$ 2.50	\$ 125.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray	\$ 2.690	\$ 134.50	Tru-Ray pac103050	\$ 3.22	\$ 161.00									
ORANGE, PACON 33C	P 06-120	50 PKGS		no bid		Tru-Ray	\$ 2.720	\$ 136.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray -05	\$ 2.59	\$ 129.50	Pacon/Tru-Ray	\$ 2.990	\$ 149.50	Tru-Ray (burgundy) y38158	\$ 5.39	\$ 269.50									
PINK, PACON 35C	P 06-130	50 PKGS		no bid		Tru-Ray	\$ 2.780	\$ 139.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray -05	\$ 2.66	\$ 133.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray	\$ 2.890	\$ 144.50	Tru-Ray 03034	\$ 3.29	\$ 164.50									
HOLIDAY RED, PACON 835C	P 06-140	50 PKGS		no bid		Tru-Ray	\$ 2.210	\$ 110.50	Pacon/Tru-Ray -05	\$ 2.69	\$ 134.50	Pacon/Tru-Ray	\$ 2.890	\$ 144.50	Tru-Ray 03044	\$ 3.28	\$ 164.00									
SLATE GRAY, PACON 565C	P 06-150	50 PKGS		no bid		Tru-Ray	\$ 2.600	\$ 130.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray -21	\$ 2.64	\$ 132.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray	\$ 2.890	\$ 144.50	Tru-Ray 02994	\$ 3.87	\$ 193.50									
TURQUOISE, PACON 85C	P 06-160	50 PKGS		no bid		Tru-Ray	\$ 2.440	\$ 122.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray 054	\$ 2.59	\$ 129.50	Pacon/Tru-Ray	\$ 2.790	\$ 139.50	Tru-Ray 1388073	\$ 4.91	\$ 245.50									
VIOLET, PACON 115C	P 06-170	50 PKGS		no bid		Tru-Ray	\$ 2.600	\$ 130.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray -05	\$ 2.66	\$ 133.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray	\$ 2.990	\$ 149.50	Tru-Ray 03039	\$ 3.28	\$ 164.00									
WHITE, PACON 535C	P 06-180	50 PKGS		no bid		Tru-Ray	\$ 2.610	\$ 130.50	Pacon/Tru-Ray -05	\$ 2.62	\$ 131.00	Pacon/Tru-Ray	\$ 2.890	\$ 144.50	Tru-Ray pac103041	\$ 3.16	\$ 158.00									
YELLOW, PACON 55C	P 06-190	50 PKGS		no bid		Tru-Ray	\$ 2.510	\$ 125.50	Pacon/Tru-Ray -05	\$ 2.19	\$ 109.50	Pacon/Tru-Ray	\$ 2.490	\$ 124.50	Tru-Ray 03058	\$ 3.40	\$ 170.00									
PAPER TOWELS: Multi-fold;	P 35-000	300 Cases	Right Choice #0012	\$ 15.70	\$ 4,710.00										Pacific Blue Basic 245	\$ 27.77	\$ 8,331.00	NPS 21580-CC	\$ 15.32	\$ 4,596.00						
TOILET TISSUE:	P 36-000	100 Cases	Nittany Paper	\$ 37.95	\$ 3,795.00										Tork TM6120	\$ 50.71	\$ 5,071.00	NPS 12440-CC	\$ 40.44	\$ 4,044.00						
BOND PAPER: WHITE	P 41-100	2000 CASES		no bid											Hammermill 893760	\$ 48.76	\$ 97,520.00				Natural Choice 3	\$ 25.480	\$ 50,960.00			
BOND PAPER: GOLDENROD	P 46-030	50 REAMS		no bid					Hammermill -1060	\$ 7.08	\$ 354.00				Hammermill 103168	\$ 6.23	\$ 311.50				Premium Colors	\$ 3.940	\$ 197.00			
Bond Paper: Green; 20#; 8 1/2 x 11	P 46-040	80 Reams		no bid					Hammermill -1061	\$ 7.08	\$ 566.40				Hammermill 841529	\$ 5.35	\$ 428.00				Premium Colors	\$ 3.940	\$ 315.20			
Bond Paper: Pink; 20#; 8 1/2 x 11	P 46-050	50 Reams		no bid					Hammermill -1061	\$ 7.08	\$ 354.00				Hammermill 103382	\$ 6.23	\$ 311.50				Premium Colors	\$ 3.940	\$ 197.00			
Bond Paper: Gray; 20#; 8 1/2 x 11	P 46-060	20 Reams		no bid					Hammermill -1061	\$ 7.08	\$ 141.60				Hammermill 105529H	\$ 6.81	\$ 76.20				Premium Colors	\$ 3.940	\$ 78.80			
Bond Paper: Ivory; 20#; 8 1/2 x 11	P 46-070	20 Reams		no bid					Hammermill -1061	\$ 7.08	\$ 141.60				Hammermill 103176	\$ 6.23	\$ 124.60				Premium Colors	\$ 3.940	\$ 78.80			
NCR Paper: 8 1/2 x 11; 2-part Reverse; pre collated	P 49-002	100 Reams		no bid						no bid																
NCR Paper: 8 1/2 x 11; 3-part Reverse; pre collated	P 49-003	100 Reams		no bid					NCR NCR5900-14	\$ 27.36	\$ 2,736.00															
INDEX PAPER: BUFF; 90#; 8 1/2" x 11"	P 49-400	20 Reams		no bid						no bid					Springhill 194954imp	\$ 20.99	\$ 419.80									
INDEX PAPER: SALMON; 90#; 8 1/2" x 11"	P 49-401	10 Reams		no bid						no bid																
INDEX PAPER: GRAY; 90#; 8 1/2" x 11"	P 49-404	20 Reams		no bid						no bid					Exact 491910n1	\$ 8.98	\$ 179.60									
ENVELOPES: MANILA 6"x9"; 28#; 100 PER BOX	P 58-010	10 Boxes		no bid						Quality Park -4	\$ 10.950	\$ 109.50														
ENVELOPES: MANILA 9"x12"; 28#; 100 PER BOX	P 58-040	30 Boxes		no bid						Quality Park -4	\$ 13.950	\$ 418.50														
ENVELOPES: White #10; Plain 24#; Executive Style	P 59-020	50 Boxes		no bid						Quality Park -1	\$ 10.950	\$ 547.50														
INDEX CARDS: 4" x 6" Plain White 90# basis - 100 p	P 65-020	20 PKGS		no bid						Oxford 40EE-1443	\$ 0.58	\$ 11.60			Oxford 40	\$ 0.690	\$ 13.80	Oxford 40 qqg	\$ 0.94	\$ 18.80						
INDEX CARDS: 5" x 8" Plain White 90# basis - 100 p	P 65-030	20 PKGS		no bid						Oxford 50EE-1433	\$ 0.99	\$ 19.80			Oxford 50	\$ 1.190	\$ 23.80	Oxford 50 qq	\$ 1.39	\$ 27.80						
INDEX CARDS: 4" x 6"; Ruled white; 90#; 100 per p	P 66-020	20 PKGS		no bid						Oxford 41EE-1381	\$ 0.58	\$ 11.60			Oxford 41	\$ 0.690	\$ 13.80	Oxford 41 qq	\$ 0.84	\$ 16.80						
TAPE: MASKING: 3/4" x 60-yard roll; crepe; genera	P 81-000	600 Rolls		no bid						Highland 2600 3/4"	\$ 1.03	\$ 618.00			Shurtape cp10	\$ 0.790	\$ 474.00	3m 701837	\$ 1.49	\$ 894.00						
TAPE: TRANSPARENT: Clear; 1/2" x 1296"; neatly	P 83-000	500 Rolls		no bid						Highland 6200-123	\$ 0.7975	\$ 401.94			3m Highland 6	\$ 0.580	\$ 290.00	Highland 6200121294	\$ 0.85	\$ 425.00						
Theme Paper: 16# White; 8 1/2" x 11" ruled 3/8" s	P 91-010	50 reams		no bid						American Pap	\$ 4.390	\$ 219.50														
Theme Paper: 16# Yellow; 8 1/2" x 11" ruled 3/8" s	P 91-020	50 reams		no bid						American Pap	\$ 4.390	\$ 219.50														
<b>Grand Total</b>					\$ 8,505.00			\$ 3,438.00			\$ 5,327.20			\$ 5,290.40			\$ 117,285.10			\$ 8,640.00			\$ 51,826.90			\$ 9,863.00
<b>Award Total</b>					\$ -			\$ -			\$ 5,327.20			\$ 2,418.00			\$ 675.60			\$ 8,640.00			\$ 51,748.00			\$ -